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General Cable is a highly recognized manufacturer of a comprehensive line of 
Central Office cable. As a primary national supplier, our top-quality product 
line includes cables with the ability to run both analog and digital services. 
General Cable’s preferred central office cables are engineered for T1, DS1, 
DS1C, DS2 and other broadband services.

Designed to provide the optimum in performance, the products’ transmission, 
physical and mechanical characteristics are committed to the highest 
standards of product quality. All of these cables provide enhanced crosstalk 
and attenuation performance for customers who need broadband solutions.  
In addition, Telcordia test reports are available upon request for the 
terminating cable line of products.

With extended experience in the field of cross-connect wires, General 
Cable provides a variety of indoor and outdoor UL-listed cross-connect and 
distributing frame wire for interconnecting equipment and supplying service 
in central offices, distribution cabinets and point-to-point hookups.

General Cable meets installers’ needs with a breadth of products for virtually 
any application. Aimed at providing convenience and flexibility, all cables are 
manufactured, tested and approved to UL, the NEC and applicable TIA/EIA 
and Telcordia standards.

With years of technical expertise and a focus on cultivating strong 
relationships, General Cable provides customers with first-class technical 
support and a competitive advantage. For more than a century and a half, 
General Cable has stayed ahead of the industry’s changing needs with a 
variety of products that meet future performance requirements and provide 
the best value in cabling solutions. General Cable’s cross-connect and 
distribution frame wire offer unparalleled, world-class quality.
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